
 
 

Step By Step Guide on Applying for Bursary/Financial Assistance 

 
 

Step 1: Click Student Login and log 
in to ITE Portal 

 
 

Step 2: Click on iStudent icon 

 
 

Step 3: Click on Financial 
Assistance icon 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  

Step 4: Select Bursary/Financial 
Assistance and click “Next” 



 
 

 

Step 5: Read instructions on how to 
complete the form and click “Next” 

 

Step 6: Fill in particulars of 
immediate family (may or may not be 
living with you) and non-immediate 
family (living with you) 

 

Step 7: Attach income documents of 
the family members or submit hard 
copy of the income documents to 
your College Student Services 
Centre. 
 
Please refer to Step 8 on how to 
download digital CPF statements 
using the CPF Mobile App. 
 
Go to Step 9 after attaching all 
income documents. 
 

 

Step 8:  View and save a pdf copy of 
CPF Contribution History.  Please do 
not submit hardcopy statement. 
 



 
 

 

Step 9: Check the declaration and 
click “Confirm” 

 

Step 10: Acknowledgement Slip will 
be created. Click on “Finish” to 
complete the application.  

Location of Student Services Centre  
 
College Central: Block A Level 3 Student and Career Service Centre 
 
College East: Student Services Centre Administration Block, #01-03 (Beside Customer & 
Visitor Centre) 
 
College West: Block 3 Level 2 Student Service Centre 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 

How to Check Your Financial Assistance Status? 

 
 

Step 1: Click Student Login and log 
in to ITE Portal 

 
 

Step 2: Click on iStudent icon 

 

Step 3: Click on Student Center icon 

 

Step 4: Click on either: 
“View Financial Assistance 
Application Status”  
or “View Financial Assistance Award 
Summary” 
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